
Company 12" 15" 18" 24" 24" 30" 36" 48"
16 ga 16 ga 16 ga 16 ga 14 ga 14 ga 14 ga 12 ga

Cadillac Culvert $ 8.74 $ 10.98 $ 12.99 $ 17.08 $ 21.84 $ 27.44 $ 33.04 $ 65.52
Jensen Bridge $ 10.45 $ 14.51 $ 17.55 $ 22.85 no bid $ 32.95 $ 39.55 $ 84.09
Milan Supply Co. $ 10.44 $ 13.78 $ 16.41 $ 21.70 no bid no bid $ 41.59 $ 71.39
St. Regis $ 10.05 $ 12.60 $ 15.75 $ 19.95 no bid $ 33.00 $ 39.60 $ 71.50

Galvanized CMP, price per foot.

ANTRIM COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
CULVERT BIDS
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