

ANTRIM COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

Afton Stone Bids

As read, April 11, 2012

Contractor	At Pit	Delivered to yard at:				Delivered and spread to:		
		Mancelona	Central Lake	Kewadin	Atwood	Lakeshore Drive	Cemetery Road	Soderquist Road
Elmer's Crane and Dozer	no bid	\$14.62	\$14.62	\$16.19	\$13.40	no bid	no bid	no bid
Michigan Aggregate	no bid	\$12.50	\$13.50	\$14.00	\$12.50	no bid	no bid	no bid
Poquette Leasing Company	no bid	\$11.88	\$12.50	\$12.71	\$11.78	\$14.95	\$15.19	\$14.44
Rieth-Riley Construction	\$4.90	\$11.95	\$12.55	\$12.80	\$11.85	\$15.20	\$15.65	\$14.85

All prices are per ton.

It was moved by Hunt and seconded by Dobrzelewski to accept the low bid of Rieth-Riley for afton stone, at plant, and the low bid of Poquette Leasing for afton stone delivered, all locations, and afton stone delivered & spread, all locations. Motion carried by unanimous yes vote. April 17, 2012