

# ANTRIM COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

## *USED EQUIPMENT BIDS*

As read, July 14, 2015

Bidder	1997 GMC pickup #004	1974 Oshkosh #046	1991 Cat D4C #106	2005 Dodge pickup #118
Everett Homan	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$702.00
Roger McDaniel	\$601.00	no bid	\$2,600.00	no bid
Randy Sexton	\$305.00	no bid	\$2,511.00	\$1,065.00
Bill Simpson	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$350.00
Jim Swain	\$650.00	\$2,275.00	\$4,150.00	\$1,050.00
Tom Webb	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$818.00

High bid

scrap value

\$231.00

\$1,160.00

\$1,065.00

\$256.00