

ANTRIM COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

Afton Stone Bids

As read, May 14, 2013

Contractor	At Pit	Delivered to yard at:				Del & Spread:
		Mancelona	Central Lake	Kewadin	Atwood	Cinder Hill Road
Elmer's Crane and Dozer	no bid	\$15.73	\$16.73	\$18.23	\$16.97	\$15.73
J & N	no bid	\$14.00	\$16.50	\$17.50	\$14.70	\$12.90
Poquette Leasing Company	no bid	\$12.07	\$12.81	\$13.02	\$11.97	\$12.59
Rieth-Riley Construction	\$5.10	\$12.20	\$12.98	\$13.20	\$12.20	\$12.96
Sackrider	no bid	\$13.18	\$14.30	\$15.90	\$13.76	\$13.72

All prices are per ton.